RESOLUTION NO. 39-2014 Offered by

A RESOLUTION ACCEPTING THE BID OF FINLEY FIRE EQUIPMENT,
INC. FOR EQUIPMENT FOR THE RESCUE PUMPER APPARATUS FOR
THE FIRE DEPARTMENT, AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

WHEREAS, competitive bids were received by the Service Director for the purchase of
equipment for the rescue pumper apparatus for the Fire Department; and

WHEREAS, the Service Director has recommended that the bid of Finley Fire
Equipment, Inc. be accepted by this Council, as being the lowest and best bid, in the amount of
$46,268.00; and

WHEREAS, this Council wishes to accept the bid of Finley Fire Equipment, Inc. as being
the lowest and best bid.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Council of the Village of Richfield,
County of Summit, State of Ohio, that:

SECTION 1.

SECTION 2.

SECTION 3.

SECTION 4.

SECTION 5.

{01586303 - 1}

The bid of Finley Fire Equipment, Inc. for equipment for the rescue pumper
apparatus for the Fire Department in the amount of Forty-Six Thousand Two
Hundred and Sixty-Eight Dollars ($46,268.00), being the lowest and best bid, is
hereby accepted, in accordance to the Memorandum of the Service Director
attached hereto as “Exhibit A” and incorporated fully herein.

The Mayor and Finance Director are authorized and directed to enter into a
contract with Finley Fire Equipment, Inc. for the purchase of said equipment
pursuant to the bid.

That there be appropriated from the Fire Equipment Fund — Capital Equipment
$46,268.00.

It is found and determined that all formal actions of this Council concerning and
relating to the adoption of this Resolution were adopted in an open meeting of this
Council, and that all deliberations of this Council and of any of its committees
that resulted in such formal action, were in meetings open to the public, in
compliance with legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio
Revised Code.

This Resolution is hereby declared to be an emergency measure, necessary for the
immediate preservation of the public health, safety and welfare of the residents of
the Village and for the further reason that it is necessary that the purchase of the
emergency response equipment approved herein be made at the earliest possible
time; wherefore, provided this Resolution receives the affirmative vote of two-
thirds of the members of Council elected or appointed, it shall take effect



immediately upon its passage and execution by the Mayor; otherwise, it shall take
effect and be in force from and after the earliest period allowed by law.

PASSED:
President of Council
Mayor
Dated:

ATTEST:

Clerk of Council
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VILLAGE OF RICHFIELD

Crossroads of Community and Commerce

Legislation Request

Requested by:

Melanie Baker, Service Director

Date: 4/7/2014

Date of Mtg. needed: Council Meeting 4/15/201 4

Type of legislation:

x | Resolution Ordinance

Purchase of a Fire Rescue Pumper Equipment for the Fire
Department.

Departments involved: Fire

Legislation:

to allow the Mayor and Finance Director to enterin a
contract with Finley Fire Equipment, Inc. 5255 St. Rt. 60 NW,
McConnesville, Ohio 43756 for the purchase for equipment for the

rescue pumper apparatus for the Fire Department and declaring an
emergeny.

Executive Summary:

This is a purchase that was a part of the Mayor’s Budget for the

2014 fiscal year. This is a purchase that has been a part of the 5 year
capital improvement budget. This is a purchase that place the necessary
equipment onto the rescue pumper apparatus purchased from Pierce
Manufacturing. This equipment will allow the Fire Department to meet
NFPA standards and allow for the continued high level of safety services
provided to our residents, commercial businesses and traveling public.
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Legislation Request Fire Rescue Pumper Equipment
THE OHIO LEGAL BLANK CO., INC

EXHIBIT

A




History:

Bidding:

Bid:
Competitive Bid:
State Bid: No

Other: N/A

With Councils approval on February 4, 2014 of Resolution 13-
2014 to allow the Service Director to advertise for bids for the
purchase of a new fire rescue pumper, advertising took place
on Monday March 10, 2014 and Monday March 17, 2014 in
the Akron Beacon Journal.

There were 5 bids packets pulled.

Bids were publically opened on Wednesday, March 26, 2014 at
10:00 a.m.

There were two bids received for the fire rescue pumper equipment. The
only bid that was complete and provided the best prices was Finley Fire
Equipment.

The bid from Finley Fire Equipment was $46,268.00.

Yes

Appropriations:

1. That there be appropriated from the
Fire Equipment Fund — Capital Equipment  $46,268.00.

Purpose & Explanation

The Fire Rescue Pumper Equipment has been on the five year plan for replacement for
approximately 3 years. The need for this vehicle and equipment was discussed at length and
reviewed for the last 18 months by the Richfield Fire Department personnel. The Fire
Department Personnel and Council discussed this purchase for approximately 6 months and
agreed to the purchase as a part of the 2014 and 2015 budget years.
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Decision for purchase

The decision for the Fire Rescue Pumper Equipment was decided and agreed to by a
committee formed by the Richfield Fire Department personnel at the direction of Fire Chief
Mihalek. Various vehicles were discussed and reviewed. The choice of vehicle, specifications,
safety features, size, and equipment were discussed at length and agreed to by the committee.
Those decisions formed the bid specifications, the equipment list that was bid and the radios
that will be used in the apparatus.

Timing

We would request that this legislation have the emergency clause and be approved
immediately. Time is of the essence both for the vehicle and equipment.

Attachments

Bid tabulation sheet indicating the two bids received, and a detailed bid sheet
showing the bid tabs for Finley Fire Equipment and Fire Safety Services.

3
4/7/2014
Legislation Request Fire Rescue Pumper Equipment




00szy'vs | - |- ooszres | - - - 00'181°165$ X X | Sussgn X S 90301d
- - - 00°892°9+$ - X X X X -ou ‘or AoTury

S9OTAINS

- - - 62°9¥8°0CS - X X X X fyeyes a1
- Z SHATPLIY
10 10 150D 150D 350D noisnyjo)-woN | puog # 1# Aaedaxo)y
HAV + T#IIV + pauIquIo)) ywomdmby smeseddy pusnbureq pid | wWnpuIppy | WMpUIPPy
A G A 1 T T8d-vqeL - qBL " FqEL ¥ qel L9qelL. G qel | 54 pUoddg | sJISNT 12400
000 T sux [, uedQ pid

FIOC9CPRN 21 wedO prg
jewdmbg 1o/pue smereddy ssdumd 951 PlegYIR]

DPIoLYoRd JO 95EIA




Richfield Rescue Pumper Equipment List

Bid Sheet 3/10/2014
Page1of3
Finley Fire  Fire Safety
Item Qty. | Cost/ | Cost/
No. Product Description neeed | item item
1 21" Direct Drive PPV Fan with 6.5 HP Honda Engine 1 1,750.00|  2,283.00
2 16" Smoke Ejector 1/3 HP 1 675.00 870.00
3 Door Fan Hanger 1 80.00 295.00
4 Fan Hanging Bracket Set 1 35.00 42.00
5 14" Rotary Rescue Saw 94cc 1 1,385.00] no bid
6 Truck Strut Stabilization Kit — 2 short / 2 long 1 3,900.00] no bid
7 Hydraulic Ram 6” opening 1 1,725.00] 1,843.00
8 Standard Duty Air Hammer Kit 1 715.00| no bid
9 Tracer Voltage Detector 1 235.00 no bid
10 Sensit Gold G2 4 Gas Detector {or equivalent) 1 1,750.00;  1,275.00
11 Battery Powered Windshield Saw Kit 1 625.00f nobid
12 2.5 Gal. Water Extinguisher with Foam Nozzle 2 130.00 each }149.00 each
13 10lb CO2 Extinguisher with Hose 1 225.00 184.00
14 Elevator Key Set 1 160.00 165.00
15 30" Bolt Cutters 1 75,00 77.00
16 K Tool Kit 1 125.00 121.80
17 30" Halligan Bar with 8lb Maul and Strap 1 250.00 266.00
18 30" Halligan Bar 1 195.00 180.00
19 Irons Sling 1 52.00 40.00
20 4’ New York Style Roof Hook 1 70.00 76.00
21 6’ New York Style Roof Hook 1 80.00 88.00
22 4’ Drywall Hook with D Handle 1 72.00 76.00
23 Pick Head Axe 1 48,00 55.00
24 Flat Head Axe 2 45.00 each |47.00 each
25 51" Pry Bar 1 45.00 48.59
26 100’ Rope Search Kit 1 95.00] no bid
27 Span-Hammer 1 75.00] no bid
28 Span-Hammer Holder 1 55.00] no bid
29 2 Spanners and 1 Hydrant Wrench with Holder 3 95.00 each  |100.00 each
30 LDH/Rocker Spanner Wrench 6 18.00 each no bid
31 Double LDH Spanner Holder 3 55.00 each .| nobid
32 200’ %' Static Life Safety Rope 1 225.00[ nobid
33 300’ %' Static Life Safety Rope 1 335.00] nobid
34 200’ 4:1 Confined Space Haul Kit 1 450.00] nobld
35 Ladder Rescue System 1 450.00f no bid
36 Class Ill Style Rescue Harness 4 335.00 each no bid
37 USAR Style Rescue Helmet with Goggles 4 140.00 each no bid
38 Truck Cache Bag 1 235,00 nobid
39 Medium Rope Bag 1 35,00 no bid
40 Large Rope Bag 1 45.00f nobid
41 NFPA Rescue 8 2 40.00 each no bid
42 Rescue NFPA Carabineer 8 18.00 each no bid
43 Rescue Pulleys 4 45,00 each no bid

88




Richfield Rescue Pumper Equipment List

Bid Sheet 3/10/2014
Page 2 of 3
Flnley Fire  Fire Safety
Item Qty. | Cost/ | Cost/
No. Product Description neeed | item item
44 Rescue Rack 1 75.00] nobid
45 Large Self Braking Descender 2 190.00 each no bid
46 MPD Descender (or equivalent) 1 675.00f nobid
47 PFD Vest 2 90.00 each no bid
48 40’ 2” Webbing 2 26.00 each no bid
49 12’ 1” Webbing 1 5.00f no bid
50 20’ 8mm Prusik Cord 2 12.00 each no bid
51 Medium Anchor Strap 1 43.00] nobid
52 Large Anchor Strap 1 45,00 nobid
53 Medium Anchor Strap Sleeve 1 36,00 nobld
54 Large Anchor Strap Sleeve 1 38.00] nobid
55 Leather Rappel Gloves 4 34.00 each no bid
56 Ladder Rescue System 1 450.00| no bid
57 200’ 4:1 Haul Kit 1 450.00] nobid
58 4.5” NH F x 5” Storz Long Handle Adapter 1 155.00 163.00
59 2.5” AK Female x 2.5” NH Male 1 26.00 36.00
60 2.5” Double Female 2 28.00 each  ]30.00 each
61 2.5” Double Male 2 20.00 each 116.50 each
62 1.5” Double Female 1 20.00 20.00
63 1.5" Double Male 1 15.00 13.50
64 Portable Monltor with Nozzle and Bracket {equivalent to R.A.M.) 1 2,255.00| 2,470.00
65 2.5” Inline Gauge 1 130.00 135.05
66 2.5" Fx(2) 1.5” M Gated Wye 1 285.00 120.00
67 2.5” Cellar Nozzle 1 455.00 495,00
68 3’ Piercing Nozzle 1 685.00 720.00
69 1.5” Shutoff for Piecing Nozzle 1 250.00 259.00
70 6" Low Level Strainer 1 345.00 330.00
71 Jumbo Siamese 5” Storz x (2) 5” Storz 775.00 823.00
72 Water Thief 1 880.00] 1,145.00
73 Gated Wye 2.5” x {2) 1.5" M 1 285.00 220.00
74 3 Way Manifold 5” Storz x (3) 2.5” NHM 1 1,075.00 867.00
75 2.5" Hydrant Gate Valve 1 285.00 195.00
76 Hydrant Bag with Reinforced Bottom 1 85.00 87.45
77 Gripper Style Hotel Pack System 2 105.00 each {108.00 each
78 1.5” Smooth Bore Nozzle with 15/16 Orifice 2 275.00 each }477.00 each
79 Stacked Tip Set 2 100.00 each {154.00 each
80 2.5” Smooth Bore Nozzle with 1 3/8" Orifice 1 350.00 153.00
81 11/8” Tip 1 45,00 76.00
82 1.5” Fog Nozzle 2 550.00 each ]775.00 each
83 2.5" Fog Nozzle 1 600.00 715.00
84 5" x 100’ Nitrile Rubber LDH — Storz Coupling 10 {545.00each | nobid
85 5” x 50’ Nitrile Rubber LDH — Storz Coupling 1 340.00f no bid
86 5” x 25’ Nitrile Rubber LDH — Storz Coupling 2 230,00each no bid
87 2.5” x 50’ DJ Hose — Coated 12 |145.00 each no bid
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Richfield Rescue Pumper Equipment List

Bid Sheet 3/10/2014
Page3of 3
Finley Fire  Fire Safety
ltem Qty. | Cost/ | Cost/
No. Product Description neeed | item item
88 1,75" x 50' D) Hose ~ Coated 26  |110,00 each no bid
89 2" x 100’ DJ Hose — Coated 2 350.00 each no bid
90 2.5” x 10’ DJ Hose — Coated 1 120.00f no bid
91 Under Helmet Wireless Headset 1 550.00{ no bid
92 Single Channel Base Station 1 450,00 nobid
93 Mobile Radio Interface 1 195.00| nobid
94 Base intercom 1 195.00] no bid
95 Headset Hanger Hook 1 5.00] nobid

Total items needed:l

Total cost of all items|

(Place total cost on proposal sheet and attach these sheets to bid proposal.}
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